
 

      Soldiers’ Settlement Home Learning Plan  

Stage 2 Home Learning Plan Week 11 

 Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday 

Morning 

 

 

 

 

(30 mins) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

English  

Reading 

 (to self or someone else)  

Read a story of your 
choosing from home or on 
Epic! and complete the 
activities below in your 
exercise book provided. 

* Choose 10 interesting 
words from your story and 
re-write them into your 
own sentences? 

Circle the words that you 
choose in your sentence. 

 

 

 

Spelling  

Choose 1 or 2 spelling 

English  

Reading  

(to self or someone else)  

Read a story of your 
choosing from home or on 
Epic! and answer the 
following questions in your 
exercise book provided. 

* What was the main idea 
of the story? 

* What was your favourite 
part and why? 

 

 

 

 

 

Spelling 

English 

Reading  

(to self or someone else)  

Read a story of your 
choosing from home or on 
Epic! and complete the 
activities below in your 
exercise book provided. 

* Tell a family member 
about the story you have 
read. 

* Write a list of 8 adjectives 
(describing words e.g. 
happy, tall, kind) to 
describe the main 
character.  

 

Spelling  

Choose 1 or 2 spelling 
activities from the spelling 

English  

Reading 

 (to self or someone else)  

Read a story of your choosing 
from home or on Epic! and 
complete the activities below 
in your exercise book 
provided. 

* Draw a picture of your 
favourite character or thing 
from the story and write a 
short description about 
them. 

* What was your favourite 
part and why? 

 

 

Spelling 

Choose 1 or 2 spelling 

Easter Break 

 

Have a very happy and 
safe Easter break 
team. We are here for 
you. See you all soon. 

 

Miss Jackson 

Miss Fursey 

Mr Bridges 

Mrs Strbac 

Miss Cummings 

https://www.getepic.com/
https://www.getepic.com/
https://www.getepic.com/
https://www.getepic.com/
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(30 mins) 

 

 

 

 

(60 mins) 

activities from the spelling 
grid to practice your words in 
your exercise book provided. 

Writing  

Editing a passage for 
mistakes.  

Read and edit the passage 
about a packet of sweets.  

 

Re-write the edited passage 
neatly and correctly in your 
exercise book provided or in 
the space provided in the 
google slides. 

 

 

Choose 1 or 2 spelling 
activities from the spelling 
grid to practice your words in 
your exercise book provided.  

 

Writing  

Persuasive writing.  

Choose 1 of the persuasive 
writing topics about school 
and write a persuasive text  
in your exercise book 
provided. 

 

Remember your structure: 

- Introduction 

- 3 Reasons plus an   

  example 

- Conclusion 

 

Remember to use correct 
punctuation, paragraphs and 
edit your work when finished.  

grid to practice your words in 
your exercise book provided.  

 

Writing  

Story writing using a 
picture stimulus.  

In your exercise book 
provided, write an 
imaginative story using the 
picture stimulus provided in 
the google slides or in your 
take home pack.  

 

Try to use paragraphs, 
interesting and descriptive 
language. Remember to use 
correct punctuation (capital 
letters, full stops…) and edit 
your writing when finished.    

            Have fun! 

activities from the spelling grid 
to practice your words in your 
exercise book provided.  

 

Writing  

Acrostic Poetry Writing.   

In your exercise book 
provided, write an acrostic 
poem using ‘EASTER’  as 
your theme. 

Easter 

E 

A 

S 

T 

E 

R 

 

Remember, each letter in 
EASTER starts a new 
sentence in your poem. Have 
fun, be imaginative and 
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creative. Happy Easter! 

Break  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

    

 

 

Middle 

(60 mins) 

Mathematics 

Warm up (online): Practice 
your 7 times tables and 
division skills playing ‘Hit the 
Button’ 

https://www.topmarks.co.u
k/maths-games/hit-the-
button 

 

Topic: Addition and 
Subtraction 

Choose 2 activities from the 
addition and subtraction grid 
and complete these tasks in 
your exercise book provided. 

Mathematics  

Warm up (online): Practice 
your 7 times tables and 
division skills playing ‘Hit the 
Button’ 

https://www.topmarks.co.u
k/maths-games/hit-the-
button 

 

Topic: Multiplication and 
Division 

Choose 2 activities from the 
addition and subtraction grid 
and complete these tasks in 
your exercise book provided. 

Mathematics  

Warm up (online): Practice 
your time reading skills 
playing ‘Telling the time’ 

https://mathsframe.co.uk/e
n/resources/resource/116/t
elling-the-time 

 

 

Topic: Time 

Choose 2 activities from the 
addition and subtraction grid 
and complete these tasks in 
your exercise book provided. 

Mathematics  

Warm up (online): Practice 
your 7 times tables and 
division skills playing ‘Hit the 
Button’ 

https://www.topmarks.co.uk
/maths-games/hit-the-
button 

 

Topic: Seven times table 
colour by number 

Complete the seven times 
table worksheet in your take 
home pack and then glue it 
into the exercise book 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

https://www.topmarks.co.uk/maths-games/hit-the-button
https://www.topmarks.co.uk/maths-games/hit-the-button
https://www.topmarks.co.uk/maths-games/hit-the-button
https://www.topmarks.co.uk/maths-games/hit-the-button
https://www.topmarks.co.uk/maths-games/hit-the-button
https://www.topmarks.co.uk/maths-games/hit-the-button
https://mathsframe.co.uk/en/resources/resource/116/telling-the-time
https://mathsframe.co.uk/en/resources/resource/116/telling-the-time
https://mathsframe.co.uk/en/resources/resource/116/telling-the-time
https://www.topmarks.co.uk/maths-games/hit-the-button
https://www.topmarks.co.uk/maths-games/hit-the-button
https://www.topmarks.co.uk/maths-games/hit-the-button
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Optional Activity (online): 

Click on the blue hyperlink 
and log into matific and 
complete tasks about 
addition and 
subtraction.Record the 
activities you complete in the 
table on google slides or in 
your exercise book provided. 

 

 

Optional Activity (online): 

Click on the blue hyperlink 
and log into matific and 
complete tasks about 
multiplication and division. 
Record the activities you 
complete in the table on 
google slides or in your 
exercise book provided. 

 

 

 

Optional Activity (online): 

Click on the blue hyperlink 
and log into matific and 
complete tasks about time. 
Record the activities you 
complete in the table on 
google slides or in your 
exercise book provided. 

provided. 

 

Optional Activity (online): 

Click on the blue hyperlink 
and log into matific and 
complete tasks about times 
tables.Record the activities 
you complete in the table on 
google slides or in your 
exercise book provided. 

Break  

 

 

 

 

   

 

Afternoon 

(60 mins) 

KLA Science  

Continue creating a new 
animal with a range of 
features to suit a particular 
environment and complete 
these tasks in your exercise 
book provided. 

KLA Geography  

Choose 2 activities from the 
geography activity grid and 
complete these tasks in your 
exercise book provided. 

 

KLA PDHPE  

Time to move and groove. 
Choose 3 activities from both 
the life skills and movement 
grids to complete. Keep 
yourself safe and healthy, 
team! 

 

Optional Activity: Just 

KLA CAPA  

Choose 2 activities from the 
CAPA activity grid and 
complete them according to 
their description in your 
exercise book provided. 

Be creative and have fun! 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

https://www.matific.com/au/en-au/home/
https://www.matific.com/au/en-au/home/
https://www.matific.com/au/en-au/home/
https://www.matific.com/au/en-au/home/


 

4Framework for delivering curriculum in case of school closure – K-6 template 

Dance: Eye of the tiger 

https://www.youtube.com/
watch?v=c75hMgl8VWM 

Additional 

Websites 

Music: 

- These links have a variety of on-line games with music 
https://www.learninggamesforkids.com/music_and_art_games/music_and_art_games_artist_origin.html 

https://www.musick8kids.com/html/musicgame.php 

https://www.musick8kids.com/html/play_bw.php 

- This link takes you to an interactive link. Clink on the link. Choose a rest or a note, then a note of the keyboard. Continue for 4 bars and hear your 
composition : https://www.classicsforkids.com/games/compose_your_own_music.php 

Maths: 

- Great website with a variety of games using logic, problem solving, skill and strategy : https://www.coolmathgames.com/ 

Special interest/Current Affairs for kids: 

- Behind the News (BTN) is a great ABC website specially made for kids that has videos and articles based on current issues and affairs going on in the 
world : https://www.abc.net.au/btn/  It is also on ABC me weekly at 10am on Tuesdays and repeated at 10.30am on Thursdays. 

 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=c75hMgl8VWM
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=c75hMgl8VWM
https://www.learninggamesforkids.com/music_and_art_games/music_and_art_games_artist_origin.html
https://www.musick8kids.com/html/musicgame.php
https://www.musick8kids.com/html/play_bw.php
https://www.classicsforkids.com/games/compose_your_own_music.php
https://www.coolmathgames.com/
https://www.abc.net.au/btn/

